
 

FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE: 

  

Jennifer Anderson  

Executive Director of River Oaks 

Signature Senior Living, LLC Announces the Opening of Their State of the Art Assisted 
Living and Memory Care: River Oaks in Coppell, TX in Spring 2013. 

Coppell, TX July 20, 2013 – Signature Senior Living, LLC is proud to announce that their newest assisted 
living and memory care community in Coppell, TX will be opening Spring 2013. 

River Oaks Assisted Living and  Memory Care Community located at 1530 E Sandy Lake Road  in 
Coppell, TX.  River Oaks will provide services for both assisted living and memory care residents 

Jennifer Anderson, the River Oaks Executive Director, has extensive experience in assisted living, memory 
care and geriatric services in the Coppell and surrounding area. She has been in senior housing since 1988 
in Minnesota before moving to Texas in 1997 where she opened a community in Lewisville. Jennifer 
opened and managed a Signature community in McKinney in 2010. Jennifer lives in Coppell with her 
standard poodle Tess who will be a frequent visitor in the community.  



River Oaks Assisted Living and Memory Care promote s independence, dignity and provides personal care 
customized to our resident’s individual needs and choices. We provide 24 hour staffing, 3 meals daily with 
snacks, transportation and weekly laundry and housekeeping included in your base services. Our life 
enrichment program is designed to what our residents want and also includes exercise programs, trips of 
interest, intergenerational programs with the local schools and many special events for residents and their 
families. 

Signature Senior Living, LLC is privately owned and operates out of Irving, TX. The company team has 
operated in TX for the past 22 years. 

River Oaks Assisted Living and Memory Care Community is a one story TX ranch style floor plan with 
native stone, fireplaces, ice cream parlor, internet café, many common area living spaces , private dining 
room, two enclosed courtyards and many more featured amenities.  Signature Senior Living provides a 
home like environment for our residents and families with many options in apartment styles to choose  
from. 

This community will hire 40+ employees from the surrounding area, and we look forward to working with 
the local merchants of  Coppell. We strive to become a part of the community which is the home to our 
residents.  

Please visit our website for more services, contact information, locations, floor plan options and a slide 
show view of our community: www.signatureseniorliving.com 

 


